
DAY 1 

Bangkok Suvarnabhumi Airport to Bangkok Hotel With Guide 

Duration 90 Minutes 

Pullman Bangkok Hotel G 

The Pullman Bangkok Hotel G combines the international sophistication of Accor's Pullman brand with the edgy 
style of Hotel G. This stylish lifestyle hotel in the heart of Bangkok features 469 contemporary rooms, all with floor-
to-ceiling windows overlooking Bangkok's skyline. There is also a wide range of cutting-edge food and beverage 
options, 12 meeting spaces, a fitness centre, open air swimming pool and a spa. 

Meal Plan Full Breakfast 

Duration 3 Nights 

Accommodation Pullman Bangkok Hotel G 

 

DAY 2 

Full Day Best of Bangkok Temples and Klongs 

Start the morning with a trip to Wat Pho, arguably Bangkok's most enchanting temple. Arrive just as the resident 
monks gather for their morning chants. Witness this deeply spiritual ritual and gain a better sense of Thailand's 
Buddhist heritage. After the chants, take a walk around Wat Pho and see the vast collection of religious treasures 
on display. 

The tour then continues to the nearby Grand Palace, which has served as the seat of Thailand's revered Royal 
family for more than two centuries. Take a walk around the vast grounds, stopping in to explore the various 
temples, throne halls and museums within the compound. Visit the Emerald Buddha, the most revered Buddhist 
image in Thailand, and hear about its mysterious origins. 

Take a break for lunch in a riverside restaurant, enjoying delicious Thai food with fabulous views. Then continue 
onwards to visit Wat Trimitr, on the edge of Chinatown, which houses the world's largest solid gold Buddha. 

Afterwards take a long-tail boat and move away from the high rises of the city and venture through the quiet 
canals upon which the city was originally built. Catch glimpses of the olden days, passing by charming 
neighbourhoods built on the water's edge. Return to the main waterway, the Chao Phraya River, to visit Wat Arun 
and admire its incredible decoration with ceramic tiles depicting figures of Chinese soldiers and animals. 

After a full day of exploring Bangkok, you'll be returned to your hotel in the late afternoon. 

Duration 9 Hours 

 

DAY 3 

Evening Street Food Delights by Tuk Tuk 

This evening, you will be met at your hotel by your guide who will travel with you on public transport to the 
meeting point near Hua Lumphong Station for 5:30pm. Here, you'll bet met and greeted by your local food guide 
who will offer a short briefing before this fun evening excursion commences. 



 

From here, hop on Bangkok's iconic 3-wheel tuk tuk to begin your night adventure to visit the best local eateries in 
town. Bangkok is claimed to be the city that never stops eating and locals usually find themselves eating out at 
night, especially street food, which the city is so well-known for. 

Enjoy the ride and make various stops at local places in which the smells will ignite ones taste buds. From the local 
favourite Northern Thai-Isan Food, the best kept-secret Guay Tiew Gai guaranteed with a Michelin star for 2 
consecutive years, and one of the best Pad Thais in town; popular with both locals and foreigners alike. 

In between your tasty samplings, visit Wat Pho, an iconic sight of Bangkok for a night time perspective and be 
wowed by its illuminated chedis while learning all about the history of the temple. Walk through the city's largest 
flower market, Pak Klong Talad, which is busy 24-hours a day with wholesale vendors and local shoppers. Explore 
the stalls where orchids, other flowers, vegetables and other items spill over the crowded stalls. Here, there is a 
chance to taste some local snacks or fruits. 

The night ends with a final stop outside a secret, hidden bar located by the river. Sip on a chilled Thai beer or a 
non-alcoholic drink while enjoying amazing night views of the Chao Phraya River along with the glittering Temple 
of Dawn. 

After the tour finishes, you'll be transferred back to your hotel by tuk tuk. 

Duration 4 Hours 

 

DAY 4 

Bangkok Hotel to Bangkok Suvarnabhumi Airport With Guide 

Duration 90 Minutes 

Chiang Mai Airport to Chiang Mai Hotel 

Duration 10 Minutes 

Tamarind Village 

Located at the heart of historic Chiang Mai is Tamarind Village which is a unique boutique property that serves as 
the perfect base for exploring the city's ancient temples and shopping districts. The name Tamarind comes from 
the 200-year-old tree that gives shade to the hotel, creating a cool and relaxing ambience. 

Meal Plan Full Breakfast 

Duration 3 Nights 

Accommodation Tamarind Village 

 

DAY 5 

Half Day Wat Doi Suthep and White Hmong Hilltribe 

Today, be met at your hotel by your guide and venture away from the city centre of Chiang Mai for an insightful 
look at Thailand's rich culture. Start with a visit to Wat Phra That Doi Suthep. Situated on a mountain rising high 



above the city, this sacred pagoda offers fabulous views of Chiang Mai and its surroundings. Walk up the stairs to 
see the exquisitely gilded stupa and learn about Thai Buddhist beliefs. 

Afterwards, continue higher into the hills, traveling by songtaew, a local truck. Drive along rough dirt roads to the 
Chang Khien Coffee Research Project. Enjoy a fresh cup of locally-grown Arabica coffee and hear about the North's 
flourishing coffee industry. 

It's a short drive onwards to a village inhabited by the White Hmong hilltribe. Spend time exploring the village, 
meeting the inhabitants and learning about the traditions and customs of this unique ethnic group. 

Following this insightful village visit, return to the songtaew and drive back to Chiang Mai. You will be transferred 
back to your hotel at the end of your day tour. 

Duration 5 Hours 

 

DAY 6 

Full Day Elephant Discovery Camp 

Bond and care for Asian elephants in a perfect paradise located on a secluded hill in the jungle of Chiang Mai. 
Learn from mahouts how to communicate, bathe and feed them. Then, spend some quality time interacting with 
these lumbering gentle giants. 

This morning you'll be met at your hotel and transferred to the Elephant Discovery Camp which is located on a hill 
in Mae Wang district. Have a fun experience on a short bamboo raft cruising up to the camp. 

Upon arrival at the camp, meet an elephant mahout, be introduced to the elephants, and learn about their story 
and daily lives. Interact and play with the elephants under the mahouts' supervision and watch them play in the 
mud pond. Learn to communicate with them and how to prepare nutritional food using various natural 
ingredients. Also, have fun bathing and soaking the elephants in a big pond. Lunch will be served at the camp. 

Duration 8 Hours 

 

DAY 7 

Chiang Mai Hotel to Chiang Mai Airport 

Duration 10 Minutes 

Phuket Airport to Phuket Hotel 

Duration 45 Minutes 

The Vijitt Resort Phuket 

Escape to a heavenly corner of earth at the Vijitt Resort Phuket where the pace of life is slow and the scenery is 
simply breathtaking. Situated on a tranquil beach away from the bustling tourist crowds, this luxury all-villa Phuket 
resort offers a rejuvenating retreat that exudes Thai charm. The exquisite location of the Rawai hotel was 
handpicked for its outstanding natural beauty offering wide open spaces with tall swaying palms and lush green 
lawns that gently slope towards the Andaman Sea. 

 



Meal Plan Full Breakfast 

Duration 3 Nights 

Accommodation The Vijitt Resort Phuket 

 

DAY 8 

Full Day Phang Nga Bay and James Bond Island by Private Longtail Boat 

Today, spend a day at sea visiting beautiful Phang Nga Bay from Phuket. After breakfast, you'll be met and driven 
to the jetty where a private, longtail boat awaits. Climb aboard and cast off to begin your adventure! 

Cross the emerald-green waters of the bay, passing by dramatic limestone karsts and uninhabited islands. Go 
ashore at 'James Bond Island', a distinctive rocky island that is a popular place for photos. 

The day is filled with several fantastic stops. Cruise through a pristine mangrove forest, getting a close look at the 
incredible ecosystems created by these ancient plants. Stop at secluded beaches to go swimming alongside 
colourful tropical fish. There is plenty of time to explore secluded beaches and soak up the sun. Around midday a 
scrumptious picnic lunch will be served in a scenic location. Enjoy the fresh air and tropical breeze while dining on 
a delicious meal. 

As the sun begins to dip low into the sky, return to Phuket arriving in time to watch the sunset at the end of the 
day. You'll be transferred back to your hotel. 

Duration 7 Hours 

 

DAY 9 

Day at Leisure 

Today is totally free and at leisure. You can take advantage of any optional activities available or simply relax. 

 

DAY 10 

Phuket Hotel to Phuket Airport 

Duration 45 Minutes 


